Jennifer French

From: Diane Reed <tcvscpa@gmail.com>
Sent: Sunday, January 14, 2018 6:22 PM
To: Jennifer French

Subject: Fwd: TCVSCPA Transaction Complete

Will probably want to contact her and have this be towards next years dues since it's so far into the season.

A. Diane Reed, CPA, MBA
TCVSCPA Website Administrator
757-570-8110

---------- Forwarded message ----------
From: TCVSCPA <tcvscpa@gmail.com>
Date: Sat, Jan 6, 2018 at 2:11 PM

Subject: TCVSCPA Transaction Complete
To: tcvscpa@gmail.com

TCVSCPA Transaction Complete

The user who was logged in for this transaction: 142774, Karalynn Drechsel,

KaralynnDrechsel@gmail.com

You have received a payment from Karalynn Drechsel. The information for this

payment is as follows:

Order details



Product Quantity Price

Regular Membership 1 $150.00
Subtotal: $150.00
Payment method: Credit Card
Total: $150.00

Billing address

Karalynn Drechsel

3006 Kempton Park Road
Suffolk, VA 23435
8048326599

TCVSCPA



